
SHARE YOUR WORK WITH US!

WAMPUM BELT CRAFT

@AmRevMuseum

SEND A MESSAGE WITH A WAMPUM BELT

Wampum beads, purple or white beads made from seashells, can be woven to form a belt that 

commemorates agreements between different communities. The wampum keeper is responsible for 

interpreting the belt’s designs to remember what was discussed or agreed between the two groups.

Write a message of friendship to your neighbors and family using the symbols below. 

MATERIALS

• Scissors & Tape

• Crayons or Colored Pencils

• Printout of Wampum Belt Worksheet

DIRECTIONS 

1. Color the beads to design a Wampum belt using typical symbols. 
Use the examples below for inspiration.

2. Cut the strips apart and tape them together for a longer belt.

SHAPES AND FIGURES
Human figures, diamonds 
or squares can represent 
nations (Britain, France, 
the United States, the 
Oneida nation and 
others) or communities 
like a town or village. 

COLOR
Purple and white beads 
are sometimes used to 
indicate whether the 
figure represents people 
of European or Native 
American descent.

CONNECTING LINES
Lines connecting figures 
can represent paths or 
connections, such as a 
chain of friendship, 
political ties, or economic 
ties between two nations 
or communities. 

ANIMALS
Animals and birds can 
represent a specific 
clan or family. The image  
below shows the two 
groups sitting on opposite 
sides of a council fire 
represented by the 
diamond.



D
ES

IG
N

 A
 W

A
M

PU
M

 B
EL

T 
U

SI
N

G
 T

Y
PI

C
A

L 
SY

M
BO

LS
 





https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=1cepZNz0NfA https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=1cepZNz0NfA


